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 Student Satisfaction Survey (sss) that results from evaluation of student’s experience with 
the facilities and support they received in the college is very important. It is valid and reliable 
tool to understand the key areas for further developments. Thus it allows understanding the 
resources for areas that require greater attentions. Thus it is a direct and useful indicator of the 
effectiveness of teaching learning in the college. The college encourages the students to take 
active participation in SSS. 
       One of the most important factors that affect students directly is the teaching quality factor, 
which includes curriculum, teaching techniques and methodologies, as well as testing methods. 
In our survey, we should ask your students about their opinion on what and how they are taught, 
and whether that knowledge is being effectively and fairly tested. 
         The format of the questionnaire is prepared by The IQAC.as per the suggestions and a 
guideline of the NAAC.The format contains 21 questions on five points Lickert’s scale; 
including few questions regarding personal information. The questionnaire communicated to the 
students as a “Google form “through whatsapp and telegram groups. 
         We received 380 responses approximately, 25% students responded and recorded their 
responses. Among the responses, The  proportion of girls are three time higher than that of boys, 
whereas the science and commerce Faculty Students are seen to be more aware regarding survey 
as compared to other facilities. The majority of the students regarding the teaching, 
communication of teachers, extents of syllabus covered, and preparation of teachers for the 
classes are reported as “excellent” or “satisfactory”. Approximately 88% of students feel that 
overall teaching-learning process is very good in our college. 
        The question wise Pie-charts obtained from the summary of Google form responses are self-
explanatory .These Pie-charts given below.  
 
 
 



 

          
 



    

  



 
  

   



  

 
  

   

 
 
 
 
 



   
  

 

 

  
  

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 

  
  

 
 
 

  
 
 

 
 
                      The Overall comments in the feedback are either very good or excellent regarding 
teaching, learning and evaluation process: 
Co-curricular and extra-curricular and extension activities. However there are also 
suggestions/complaints from few students such as include daily-life example while teaching use 



of LED Projector to demonstrations, through explanations of difficult concepts and elaborating 
with illustrations etc.suggestions for providing internet connectivity and spacious reading room 
in library are also received from the students. 
                       The suggestions/complaints will be considered in the follow-up meeting of IQAC 
Further IQAC in consultation with Principal will try to find out a way to fulfill demands of 
students. 
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